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Bill F Malone, Superintendant
Award approved per School Board Policy 6.14

INVITATION TO BID NO.: 11C - 58A TERM CONTRACT FOR NEW TIRES, TIRE ACCESSORIES &
SERVICE

DATE: June 6, 2011 DATE OPENED: May 25, 2011
DATE SOLICITED:  April 29, 2011 DATE POSTED: June 6, 2011

CONTRACT PERIOD: June 13, 2011 through June 12, 2012
DEPARTMENT: 9320 FUND: 1000 FUNCTION: 7802 ACCOUNT: 556100

FUNDING SOURCE: Transportation Department
REQUESTING DEPARTMENT: Transportation Department

FINANCIAL IMPACT
The estimated annual financial impact to the Transportation budget is $600,000. The source of funds

is the Transportation Department budget.

ltems to be purchased include new tires, tire accessories, and service for school buses and school district
vehicles

AWARD RECOMMENDATION / TABULATION
(See attached Bid Summary)

VENDOR MINORITY
STATUS

Boulevard Tire Center ——
Callaghan Tire -
Pride Enterprises : —
Tire .Ce-n”ters, L.I._.C | —
Tiresales of Broward, Inc. —

Wingfoot Commercial Tire System, LLC —

LEGEND:

= Award

{ ) = Reject

MINORITY - (2-African American, 3-Hispanic American, 4-Native American, 5-Asian American, 6-American
Woman, 7-Physically Impaired, 8-Other)




EXCEPTIONS:

Reject Wingfoot Commercial Tire System LLC. Vendor did not adhere to terms and conditions of
Special Condition “G” Insurance Requirements.

No Bids' Section |i - Open Market Line ltems — These items will be purchased on the open market
Line item 3
Line ltem 4

RECOMMENDATION: It is recommended that the award be made to all responsive and
responsible bidders in order to meet the needs of the School District.

Note: Original RFP / Bid document is available upon request.

BID PROTEST

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in §120.57(3), Florida Statutes, shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under
Chapter 120, Florida Statutes and applicable Board rules, regulations and policies. Offers from the vendors listed herein are the
only offers received timely as of the above opening date and time. All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if
any, are hereby rejected as late.

If a bidder wishes to protest a bid, they must do so in strict accordance with the procedures outlined in FS 120.57(3). Any person
who files an action protesting a decision or intended decision pertaining to this bid pursuant to FS 120.57(3)(b), shall post with
the Purchasing Department, at the time of filing the formal written protest, a bond secured by an acceptable surety company in
Florida payable to the School District of Palm Beach County in an amount equal to 1 percent (1%) of the total estimated contract
value, but not less than $500 nor more than $5,000. Bond shall be conditioned upon the payment of all costs that may be
adjudged against the protester in the administrative hearing in which the action is brought and in any subsequent appellate court
proceeding. In lieu of a bond, a cashier's check, certified bank check, bank certified company check or money order will be
acceptable form of security. If, after completion of the administrative hearing process and any appellate court proceedings, the
District prevails, it shall recover all costs and charges included in the final order of judgment, including charges by the Division of
Administrative Hearings. Upon payment of such costs and charges by the protester, the protest security shall be returned. If the
protest prevails, he or she shall recover from the District all costs and charges, which shall be included in the final order of

judgment.
DISQUALIFYING CRIMES

The bidder certifies by submission of this bid, that neither it nor its principals is presently débarred, suspended, proposed for
debarment, declared ineligible or voluntarily excluded from participation in this transaction by the State of Florida or Federal
Government. Further, bidder certifies that it has divulged, in its bid response, information regarding any of these actions or
proposed actions with other governmental agencies.




BID SUMMARY (BID NO. 11C-59A)

Section | - New Tires

Vendor
Wingfoot
Boulevard | Callaghan Pride Tire Tiresoles of | Commercial
Item # [Description Tire Tire Enterprises | Centers Broward Tires
1 |Bridgestone 20% 21% 0% No hid No bid No bid
2 Firestone 20% 21% 0% No bid No bid No bid
3  |Goodyear No bid No bid 0% No bid 40% (42%)
4 Michelin No bid No bid 0% 55% No bid No bid
5 Continental No bid 39% 0% 40% 39% No bid
6 |Cooper No bid No bid 0% No bid No bid No bhid
7 Dunlop No bid No bid 0% No bid No hid (42%)
8 Uniroyal No bid No bid 0% No bid No bid No hid
9 B F Goodrich No bid No bid 0% 46% No bid No bid
Section I - Tire Recapping (Re-cap Tires)
Vendor
Wingfoot
Boulevard | Callaghan Pride Tire Tiresoles of | Commercial
Item # [Description Tire Tire Enterprises | Centers Broward Tires
1 |Bandag-11R225}1¢ 93.41($ 9474 No hid No bid No bid No bid
Michelin Retread
11R 22.5 Nobid | No bid Nobid |$120.78| No bid No bid
3  |Oliver 11R-22.5 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Goodyear 11R
4 1225 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid (5120.28)
5 |Pride 11R 22.5 No bid No bid | $ 95.39{ No bid No bid No bid
Casing Repairs 11R
6 |22 $ 2250($ 10.00|$ 10.00|$ 15.63| Nobid ($35.00)
Section Il - Balance of Line
' Vendor
Wingfoot
Boulevard | Callaghan Pride Tire Tiresoles of | Commercial
Description Tire Tire Enterprises | Centers Broward Tires
Percent Discount 0% 0% 0% 45% 5% (0%])
Section IV - Tire Scrap Fee
Vendor
"Wingfoot
Boulevard | Callaghan Pride Tire Tiresoles of | Commercial
Description Tire Tire Enterprises § Centers Broward Tires
Tire Scrap Fee $6.00 $8.00 $7.00 $9.00 $8.00 ($10.00)




